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Sans Souci Public School Stage 1 Learning from home - Term 3, Week 3 2021

Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

Morning English
Connotation, Imagery and
Symbol workbook
Complete Lesson 1 - parts
1.1, 1.2, 1.3 and 1.4

You will need to watch the
connotation, imagery and
symbol video to help you
complete task 1.2.

Fitness
Go to Just Dance Kids and
select 2 of your favourite
songs. Find a suitable
space to dance along.

Spelling
Write out your spelling
words in Monday’s
column. Choose 3 words
and write them into
sentences.

English
Connotation, Imagery and
Symbol workbook
Complete Lesson 2 - parts
2.1 and 2.2

Fitness
Do 30 star jumps, 10
squats, 10 sit ups, 1
minute jog on the spot.

Spelling
Write out your spelling
words in Tuesday’s
column. Choose 5 words
and rainbow write these
using five different
colours.

Spelling Conventions
Complete activities 3 and 4
in your Spelling
Conventions book (Unit

English
Connotation, Imagery and
Symbol workbook
Complete Lesson 2 - parts
2.3 and 2.4

You will need to read or
listen to ‘Happily Haunted’
to complete task 2.3.

Fitness
Get a bouncy ball, go
outside and throw and
catch the ball 30 times.
How many times can you
clap your hands before
catching the ball? Now
bounce the ball 30 times
again. How many times
can you clap your hands in
between each bounce?

Spelling
Write out your spelling

English
Connotation, Imagery and
Symbol workbook
Complete Lesson 3 - parts
3.1 and 3.2

You will need to watch the
onomatopoeia video to
complete task 3.1.

You will need to read or
listen to ‘Happily Haunted’
to complete task 3.2.

Fitness
Do 30 star jumps, 10
squats, 10 sit ups, 1
minute jog on the spot.

Spelling
Write out your spelling
words in Thursday’s
column. Choose 5 of your
list words and create

English
Connotation, Imagery and
Symbol workbook
Complete Lesson 3 - parts
3.3 and 3.4

You will need to re-watch
onomatopoeia to
complete task 3.3.

Fitness
Go to Just Dance Kids and
select 2 of your favourite
songs. Find a suitable
space to dance along.

Spelling Conventions
Year 1 - Complete activity
9 in your Spelling
Conventions book (Unit
17).
Year 2 - Complete
activities 9 and 10 in your
Spelling Conventions book
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https://drive.google.com/file/d/1rhkqC4i96uMdSnylE5FilyUo3eD2daTR/view?usp=sharing
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1rhkqC4i96uMdSnylE5FilyUo3eD2daTR/view?usp=sharing
https://vimeo.com/398137110
https://vimeo.com/398137110
https://www.google.com/search?q=just+dance+kids&rlz=1C1GCEA_enAU961AU961&oq=just+dance&aqs=chrome.2.69i57j0i433l4j0j0i433j0j0i131i433.7416j0j4&sourceid=chrome&%7Bgoogle:instantExtendedEnabledParameter%7Die=UTF-8
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1rhkqC4i96uMdSnylE5FilyUo3eD2daTR/view?usp=sharing
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1rhkqC4i96uMdSnylE5FilyUo3eD2daTR/view?usp=sharing
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1rhkqC4i96uMdSnylE5FilyUo3eD2daTR/view?usp=sharing
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1rhkqC4i96uMdSnylE5FilyUo3eD2daTR/view?usp=sharing
https://theschoolmagazine.com.au/resources/happily-haunted
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1rhkqC4i96uMdSnylE5FilyUo3eD2daTR/view?usp=sharing
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1rhkqC4i96uMdSnylE5FilyUo3eD2daTR/view?usp=sharing
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=f1b5kCvVBo8
https://theschoolmagazine.com.au/resources/happily-haunted
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1rhkqC4i96uMdSnylE5FilyUo3eD2daTR/view?usp=sharing
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1rhkqC4i96uMdSnylE5FilyUo3eD2daTR/view?usp=sharing
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=f1b5kCvVBo8
https://www.google.com/search?q=just+dance+kids&rlz=1C1GCEA_enAU961AU961&oq=just+dance&aqs=chrome.2.69i57j0i433l4j0j0i433j0j0i131i433.7416j0j4&sourceid=chrome&%7Bgoogle:instantExtendedEnabledParameter%7Die=UTF-8


Spelling Conventions
Complete activities 1 and 2
in your Spelling
Conventions book (Unit
17).

Reading Eggs
Log on to
www.readingeggs.com
and complete one level of
your program. Read a
book which you can find in
the Library icon on your
home page of Reading
Eggs.

17).

Reading Eggs
Log on to
www.readingeggs.com
and complete one level of
your program. Read a
book which you can find in
the Library icon on your
home page of Reading
Eggs.

words in Wednesday’s
column. Rewrite them in
alphabetical order.

Spelling Conventions
Complete activities 5 and 6
in your Spelling
Conventions book (Unit
17).

Reading Eggs
Log on to
www.readingeggs.com
and complete one level of
your program. Also read a
book which you can find in
the Library icon on your
home page of Reading
Eggs.

bubble writing art.

Spelling Conventions
Complete activities 7 and 8
in your Spelling
Conventions book (Unit
17).

Reading Eggs
Log on to
www.readingeggs.com
and complete one level of
your program. Also read a
book which you can find in
the Library icon on your
home page of Reading
Eggs.

(Unit 17).

Spelling Test
Ask a parent to test you on
your spelling list. Upload
the test on Google
Classroom for your
teacher to review.

Reading Eggs
Log on to
www.readingeggs.com
and complete one level of
your program. Also read a
book which you can find in
the Library icon on your
home page of Reading
Eggs.

Break
Middle Mathematics

Thinking Mathematically
3 workbook
Complete Day 1 Tasks

You will need to watch
these three Staircase
pattern 1 videos to
complete your tasks. Scroll

Mathematics
Thinking Mathematically
3 workbook
Complete Day 2 Tasks

You will need to watch
these three Balancing
numbers 1 videos to
complete your first task.

Mathematics
Thinking Mathematically
3 workbook
Complete Day 3 Tasks

You will need to watch
these four Balancing
numbers 2 videos to
complete your first task.
Scroll down to find each

Mathematics
Thinking Mathematically
3 workbook
Complete Day 4 Tasks

Click on this link to revise
how to play Race to Zero
for your first tasks. If you
do not have your
resources from week 1 you

Mathematics
Thinking Mathematically
2 workbook
Complete Day 5 Tasks

You will need your Double
facts cards from week 2
for the first task. If you no
longer have them click
Doubles facts
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http://www.readingeggs.com
http://www.readingeggs.com
http://www.readingeggs.com
http://www.readingeggs.com
http://www.readingeggs.com
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1v1dNT6gAcnTZEF3qi0kT4Ytq8i-AWnWJ/view?usp=sharing
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1v1dNT6gAcnTZEF3qi0kT4Ytq8i-AWnWJ/view?usp=sharing
https://sites.google.com/education.nsw.gov.au/get-mathematical-stage-1/targeted-teaching/staircase-pattern
https://sites.google.com/education.nsw.gov.au/get-mathematical-stage-1/targeted-teaching/staircase-pattern
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1v1dNT6gAcnTZEF3qi0kT4Ytq8i-AWnWJ/view?usp=sharing
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1v1dNT6gAcnTZEF3qi0kT4Ytq8i-AWnWJ/view?usp=sharing
https://sites.google.com/education.nsw.gov.au/get-mathematical-stage-1/targeted-teaching/balancing-numbers-1
https://sites.google.com/education.nsw.gov.au/get-mathematical-stage-1/targeted-teaching/balancing-numbers-1
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1v1dNT6gAcnTZEF3qi0kT4Ytq8i-AWnWJ/view?usp=sharing
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1v1dNT6gAcnTZEF3qi0kT4Ytq8i-AWnWJ/view?usp=sharing
https://sites.google.com/education.nsw.gov.au/get-mathematical-stage-1/targeted-teaching/balancing-numbers-2
https://sites.google.com/education.nsw.gov.au/get-mathematical-stage-1/targeted-teaching/balancing-numbers-2
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1v1dNT6gAcnTZEF3qi0kT4Ytq8i-AWnWJ/view?usp=sharing
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1v1dNT6gAcnTZEF3qi0kT4Ytq8i-AWnWJ/view?usp=sharing
https://sites.google.com/education.nsw.gov.au/get-mathematical-stage-1/contexts-for-practise/race-to-zero
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1v1dNT6gAcnTZEF3qi0kT4Ytq8i-AWnWJ/view?usp=sharing
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1v1dNT6gAcnTZEF3qi0kT4Ytq8i-AWnWJ/view?usp=sharing
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1QidVdGXv0CmR-ESU1TREd-SL5gSR_F7O/view


down to find each part of
the video.

You may also like to view
this Numberbocks - Step
Squad episode.

Fitness
Cosmic Kids Yoga - clear
some space and follow
along with We're Going on
a Bear Hunt.

Mathletics
Log into Mathletics and
complete two of the set
tasks.

Scroll down to find each
part of the video.

You will need to watch this
Staircase pattern - part 4
to complete your second
task.

Fitness
Choose 2 of your favourite
songs and find a suitable
space to have a dance.

Mathletics
Log into Mathletics and
complete two of the set
tasks.

part of the video.

Click on this link to learn
how to play Handfuls:
thinking multiplicatively.
You will need a collection
of items like bears, LEGO
mini figs or an alternative
like toy cars, trains, or
other animal figurines.

Fitness
Draw up a hopscotch on
the driveway or a safe
concrete space with chalk
and play a game with your
family.

Mathletics
Log into Mathletics and
complete two of the set
tasks.

will also need to print out
a game board, a 0-9
spinner and a 20-70
spinner (these are also in
your workbook, p.17 and
34).

You will need to watch this
How to make a tangram
and have a square sheet of
paper for your second
task. Clink on this link to
revise how to make a
square from week 1.

Fitness
Try skipping with a rope
for 10 minutes outside.

Mathletics
Log into Mathletics and
complete two of the set
tasks.

concentration to
download the cards, print
and cut them out.

Click on this to learn how
to play For each game. You
will also need to print this
spinner (this is also in your
workbook, p.36)

Fitness
Cosmic Kids Yoga - clear
some space and follow
along with On The Farm.

Mathletics
Log into Mathletics and
complete two of the set
tasks.

Break
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https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=W6i-11Flmnw
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=W6i-11Flmnw
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=KAT5NiWHFIU
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=KAT5NiWHFIU
https://login.mathletics.com/
https://sites.google.com/education.nsw.gov.au/get-mathematical-stage-1/targeted-teaching/staircase-pattern-follow-up
https://login.mathletics.com/
https://sites.google.com/education.nsw.gov.au/get-mathematical-stage-1/contexts-for-practise/handfuls-thinking-multiplicatively
https://sites.google.com/education.nsw.gov.au/get-mathematical-stage-1/contexts-for-practise/handfuls-thinking-multiplicatively
https://login.mathletics.com/
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1Z8qrD3RRViOfQXxUfLZ3b7kOHrVKWSV2/view
https://docs.google.com/document/d/1Vry7yow8-5DQP1jRoeEYjlcytthtx0W6mQMszxSnXCM/edit
https://docs.google.com/document/d/1Vry7yow8-5DQP1jRoeEYjlcytthtx0W6mQMszxSnXCM/edit
https://docs.google.com/document/d/1n2GnmjD9MVQRN6mji1OB7NfGwJTGFFt_IepkEtV8WcI/edit
https://docs.google.com/document/d/1n2GnmjD9MVQRN6mji1OB7NfGwJTGFFt_IepkEtV8WcI/edit
https://sites.google.com/education.nsw.gov.au/get-mathematical-stage-1/targeted-teaching/how-to-make-a-tangram
https://sites.google.com/education.nsw.gov.au/get-mathematical-stage-1/targeted-teaching/how-to-make-a-square
https://sites.google.com/education.nsw.gov.au/get-mathematical-stage-1/targeted-teaching/how-to-make-a-square
https://login.mathletics.com/
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1QidVdGXv0CmR-ESU1TREd-SL5gSR_F7O/view
https://sites.google.com/education.nsw.gov.au/get-mathematical-stage-1/contexts-for-practise/for-each-game
https://drive.google.com/file/d/19SjrhMLwbao1zA9E1yHNoYiwJeEltVZl/view
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=YKmRB2Z3g2s
https://login.mathletics.com/


Afternoon Storyline Online
Go to Storyline Online and
choose a story to listen to.
Write the name of this
story onto your daily
reading log.

Art
Click on the link to
complete Art Lesson 1.

Reading
Read part or all of one of
your home readers.
Record the book/s read on
the yellow reading log in
your home reading folder.
If you do not have your
home reader, read a book
from the Reading Eggs
library as mentioned
above.

Storyline Online
Go to Storyline Online and
choose a story to listen to.
Write the name of this
story onto your daily
reading log.

Geography
Features of Places 3
Complete Activity 1 (pages
2 to 6) on Natural Features
and Human Features.

Reading
Read part or all of one of
your home readers.
Record the book/s read on
the yellow reading log in
your home reading folder.
If you do not have your
home reader, read a book
from the Reading Eggs
library as mentioned
above.

Storyline Online
Go to Storyline Online and
choose a story to listen to.
Write the name of this
story onto your daily
reading log.

Science and Technology
Material World Student
Workbook
Complete activity 1.5 -
Materials for Shelter,
2.1 - Materials for my toy’s
shelter and 2.2 - Time to
Plan (pages 8 to 11).

Reading
Read part or all of one of
your home readers.
Record the book/s read on
the yellow reading log in
your home reading folder.
If you do not have your
home reader, read a book
from the Reading Eggs
library as mentioned
above.

Storyline Online
Go to Storyline Online and
choose a story to listen to.
Write the name of this
story onto your daily
reading log.

Languages
Go to your Language
Google Classroom and
complete work provided
for Week 3.

Reading
Read part or all of one of
your home readers.
Record the book/s read on
the yellow reading log in
your home reading folder.
If you do not have your
home reader, read a book
from the Reading Eggs
library as mentioned
above.

Olympics Online
Learn about the Olympics
with Ozzie on this
educational video for kids
The Olympics With Ozzie.

PDHPE
Positive Relationships 1
Complete Lesson 1 - Facial
Expressions (pages 1 and
2).

Reading
Read part or all of one of
your home readers.
Record the book/s read on
the yellow reading log in
your home reading folder.
If you do not have your
home reader, read a book
from the Reading Eggs
library as mentioned
above.
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https://storylineonline.net/
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1uuVxR6jqBM1f5ooMAYHW8uvxalO4zqKH/view?usp=sharing
https://storylineonline.net/
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1bKamqbjbVJ65ncufs80EQY34GgZzzont/view?usp=sharing
https://storylineonline.net/
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1EcC97X14OLNkourOFz_ACpbfwY1prHLR/view?usp=sharing
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1EcC97X14OLNkourOFz_ACpbfwY1prHLR/view?usp=sharing
https://storylineonline.net/
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=Uk0tPbek-oc
https://drive.google.com/file/d/134mBdrofYpxM6rsePMnqpS0lJwQju-ek/view?usp=sharing
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